
 
HIGH-FLYING HOOPS, HILARIOUS COMEDY  

AND POSITIVE MESSAGES FOR KIDS... 

THE HARLEM AMBASSADORS 
 

Offering a unique brand of Harlem-style basketball featuring high-flying slam 
dunks, dazzling ball-handling tricks and hilarious comedy routines, the Harlem 
Ambassadors are a team of talented male and female basketball players 
(athlete-entertainers) who are drug-free and have college degrees. They are 
committed to giving their audiences quality family entertainment and serving as 
positive role models for young people.  
 

Since 1998, the Harlem Ambassadors have provided family-friendly fundraising 
events in 50 states and 20 countries and have helped community service clubs 
and non-profit organizations raise over $10 million for their communities. 

 

HARLEM AMBASSADORS HISTORY & PURPOSE: 
In 1997 sports management and marketing executive Dale Moss formed Harlem 
Ambassadors, a small business with a big mission: to provide non-profit and 
community service groups with comedy basketball show they can use as fun, 
family-friendly fundraising events. All the money raised from these events stays in 
the local community where the event is performed to fund community service 
projects and assist people in need. Moss assembled a team of young African-
American men and women who have played college basketball, earned college 
degrees, are talented comedians and basketball players, and are good citizens and 
positive role models for kids.  

During the first season in 1998, the Ambassadors performed 30 fundraising events. 
Over the years, the Harlem Ambassadors' tour schedule has grown to over 220 
events each season and includes events in all 50 states and 20 countries and tours 
to Pearl Harbor, Bosnia, Kosovo, Sarejevo, Korea, Japan, the Marshall Islands, 
Guam, the Federated States of Micronesia, Germany, England, Mexico, and Canada.  

The Harlem Ambassadors show is quality family entertainment for audiences of all 
ages, from kids to kids-at-heart. Families laugh together at the Harlem 
Ambassadors' comic antics and are amazed at their high-flying slam dunks. The 
Ambassadors play against a team comprised of people from the local community, 
adding to the show's fun and spontaneity and making every event one-of-a-kind. 

In addition to providing fundraising events, the Harlem Ambassadors entertain the 
troops at U.S. military bases overseas and at home and encourage students with 
their "Stay in School, Stay off Drugs, Don't Be a Bully" school assemblies. 

     

     

 

 

                Follow Harlem Ambassadors tour on Facebook 

 

 

 

 

 

www.harlemambassadors.com 


